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Meet Courtney Charles, a Law Enforcement professional with over two decades of 
experience, originating from the Trinidad & Tobago Prison Service and currently serving as a 
Law Enforcement Instructor at the National Security Training Academy. Courtney Charles 
has dedicated his career to enhancing the skills and knowledge of Law Enforcement Officers. 
His profound impact on the field extends beyond his years in National Security, as he plays a 
pivotal role in modelling law enforcement professionals through his role as an instructor. 
Known for his dynamic teaching style, real-world experience, and commitment to 
excellence, Courtney Charles stands as a respected figure in law enforcement education, his 
contributions have not only elevated the quality of training programs but have also inspired 
countless individuals to pursue and excel in the challenging and crucial field of law 
enforcement. 
Courtney Charles's journey in law enforcement education is anchored by a robust academic 
foundation. He holds a Certificate in Security Administration and Management from the 
Cipriani College of Labour and Co-Operative Studies, a Bachelor's degree in Criminology & 
Public Safety from the University Of Trinidad & Tobago. Eager to deepen his knowledge and 
understanding of law enforcement, he is pursuing a Masters Degree in Cybersecurity at the 
University Of Trinidad & Tobago.   
Courtney Charles’s commitment to staying at the forefront of advancements in law 
enforcement education is evident through his numerous certifications. He is a certified 
Learning Systems Development trainer, ensuring that his teaching methods align with the 
latest educational strategies. Furthermore, he holds specialized certifications in Advance 
Firearms Training, Force on Force Training, Range Safety, Defence and Arrest Tactics, 
Oleoresin Capsicum Deployment (Pepper Spray), Criminal Investigation, Interview & 
Interrogation, Use of Force and Physical Training, reflecting his dedication to equipping law 
enforcement officers with the knowledge and skills needed to navigate complex situations 
safely. 
Courtney Charles’s journey into law enforcement began on the 1st July 1996 as a Prison 
Officer. In his early years as a Prison Officer, he quickly gathered a reputation for his 
exceptional training skills and a deep understanding of training dynamics and techniques. 
His ability to connect with people on a personal and professional level and diffuse tense 
situations earned him the respect of both colleagues and the clients he served. Driven by a 
passion for sharing knowledge and fostering the development of his peers, Courtney Charles 
found a natural progression into the realm of instruction. Recognizing his potential as a 
trainer, he pursued training in instructional methods and techniques. His early experiences 
as an instructor were defined by a hands-on approach, where he seamlessly blended 
theoretical knowledge with practical insights drawn from his years on the lines. His 
commitment to cultivating a learning environment that mirrored real-world challenges 
quickly set him apart in the field of law enforcement education. 
Courtney Charles’s journey from a dedicated Prison Officer to a revered Law Enforcement 
Instructor was marked by a commitment to excellence, a passion for education, and a 
genuine desire to shape the future of law enforcement. His early experiences and notable 
achievements laid the foundation for a career dedicated to both protecting and educating 
the National Security community he so deeply cared about. 
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